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BIDDERS 1 - 4
SUMMARY OF BIDS RECEIVED FOR STATE OF CALIFORNIA

 BID DATE: September 19, 2014 EMERGENCY REPAIRS OF FISH LOUVERS THE RESOURCES AGENCY
 TIME: 12:00 AM J.E. SKINNER FISH FACILITY DEPARTMENT OF WATER RESOURCES
 PLACE: Sacramento, California STATE WATER FACILITIES
 SPEC.#: 14-20 CALIFORNIA AQUEDUCT
 CONTR.#: C51501 DELTA FIELD DIVISION

DELTA FISH SURVIVAL IMPROVEMENTS PROGRAM
CONTRA COSTA COUNTY

 BY: Lasarte CALIFORNIA

No. Addendums: 0

Item Estimated Times Markup Markup Markup Markup Markup
No. Description Dollar Value Percentage Total Percentage Total Percentage Total Percentage Total Percentage Total

1  Labor Plus Markup $150,000.00 x 20.0% $180,000.00 10.0% $165,000.00 10.0% $165,000.00 12.0% $168,000.00 19.0% $178,500.00
2  Material and Equipment, or Services Plus Markup $125,000.00 x 20.0% $150,000.00 10.0% $137,500.00 10.0% $137,500.00 20.0% $150,000.00 19.0% $148,750.00
3  Construction Equipment Plus Markup $100,000.00 x 20.0% $120,000.00 -20.0% $80,000.00 0.0% $100,000.00 -10.0% $90,000.00 19.0% $119,000.00
4  Hauling of Construction Equipment Plus Markup $10,000.00 x 20.0% $12,000.00 0.0% $10,000.00 5.0% $10,500.00 -10.0% $9,000.00 19.0% $11,900.00
5 Commercial Diving Services Plus Markup $150,000.00 x 20.0% $180,000.00 10.0% $165,000.00 10.0% $165,000.00 20.0% $180,000.00 14.0% $171,000.00

Total $642,000.00 $557,500.00 $578,000.00 $597,000.00 $629,150.00

Guarantee

Surety

Comments    X  Denotes corrected figure

Valentine CorporationSyblon Reid
111 Pelican Way

San Rafael, CA 94901Oakland, CA 94621-1901
415 453-3732

1130 Sibley Street
Folsom Ca 95630

916 351-0457(510) 636-4335

8275 San Leandro Street

916 374-9800

Cal Neva Construction            
Services Inc.

2491 Rice Avenue
West Sacramento, CA 95691

Monterey Mechanical CompanyENGINEER'S
ESTIMATE

CONTRACT AWARDED ON 
SEPTEMBER 19, 2014

EMERGENCY CONTRACT,           
NO BID BOND REQUIRED

EMERGENCY CONTRACT,           
NO BID BOND REQUIRED

EMERGENCY CONTRACT,           
NO BID BOND REQUIRED

EMERGENCY CONTRACT,           
NO BID BOND REQUIRED
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