Local Groundwater Assistance Grant Application
Schedule

ATTACHMENT 7: SCHEDULE

The attached schedule provides a detailed and realistic timeline for each task shown
on the work plan and budget. The schedule assumes a start date of February 2013 and
an 18-month timeframe.

(1) Readiness to proceed.

The City of Santa Barbara’s Resolution authorizing filing of this application for the Local Groundwater
Assistance (LGA) grant program and enter into an agreement with the State of California will be
considered for action at the City Council meeting on July 17, 2012. The City’s adopted and signed
Resolution will be sent to DWR immediately following adoption by City Council both in electronic and
hard copy formats. The City’s Long Term Water Supply Plan, adopted in 2011, as well as the City’s Urban
Water Management Plan, adopted in 2010, both indicate the City’s commitment to prepare a
Groundwater Management Plan per State legislation outlined in AB3030. The required elements of
AB3030 include control of saline water intrusion, regulation of the migration of pollutants, facilitating
conjunctive use, wellhead protection, and coordination with regulatory agencies and other stakeholders
within the groundwater basins. While the City is already undertaking most, if not all, of these efforts,
this has yet to be coordinated into a single policy document. The City is ready to proceed with the
development of a GWMP for these basins that will improve long-term water supply reliability.

(2) Environmental and other permits.
The proposed project does not include any direct or indirect changes to the existing environment nor

does it include any foreseeable changes to the environment in the future. The project does not include
construction, grading activities, or facility improvements. Since the project includes preparation of a
groundwater management plan that does not include any physical changes to the environment,
therefore, the City will file a CEQA Notice of Exemption under Section 15306, Information Collection.

(3) Explanation of obstacles to be resolved to keep program on schedule.
No obstacles are presently anticipated that would jeopardize the 2-year schedule to complete

preparation of the GWMP. However, should any obstacles arise; the issue(s) will be presented to and
discussed with the GWMP Development Team and Advisory Group to develop solutions to keep the
project on track. Furthermore, the project schedule includes three public workshops that will be used to
invite public participation and address any disputes/obstacles that may arise during development of the
GWMP. DWR would be kept apprised of any obstacles encountered and recommended solutions both
through the progress reports and timely communication between DWR and City staff.
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(4) Explanation of how the schedule was derived.

The schedule was derived based on standard practice and past experience in consultant prepared
GWMPs for other agencies. The schedule includes key milestones, specific tasks, and deliverable
dates. Based on the tasks outlined in Attachment 5, Work Plan, the project schedule for the
development of the GWMP is expected to have an 18-month duration. In order to meet the grant
schedule requirements and information provided in the LGA PSP, the commencement of the GWMP
effort is assumed to begin in February 2013 and will be completed within the required 2 year timeframe.
The overall project commences on the date of the City-adopted resolution to prepare a GWMP. The City
is confident that in combination with ongoing monitoring and study of the Basins, this proposed project
schedule provides ample time for the planned collaborative process to produce an optimum GWMP. The
proposed project schedule is shown below and is consistent with the Work Plan included as Attachment
5 and the Budget included as Attachment 6.

A brief summary of the attached schedule is provided below:

Date Activity
July 17,2012 City Council adoption of resolution to apply for a LGA Grant Application.
July 2012 through March 2013 Coordinate with USGS on ongoing Basins Studies for Seawater Intrusion Model Update.
April 2013 through July 2014 Conduct Meetings of GWMP Development Team
April 2013 through July 2014 Implement Public Outreach and Stakeholder Involvement Process.
April 2013 through July 2014 Develop technical information on groundwater management issues and develop BMO's.
May 2013 through April 2014 Conduct and review technical analyses and studies and develop programs.
March 2014 through June 2014 Perform internal technical review and QA/QC on technical deliverables.
February 2014 through July 2014 Complete draft and final GWMP
July 2014 Adopt the SB 1938 - compliant GWMP
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D Task Name Duration ‘Start Feb '13 | Mar '13 |Apr'13 | May '13 lJun'13 lJul'13 |Aug '13 |Sep'13 loct '13 | Nov '13 |Dec'13 |Jan'14 [Feb'14 | Mar '14 |Apr'14 | May '14 lJun 14 lJul'14 |Aug’
] B/m|/e B/ m|€e B/mM E B|/M|E B|M E|lB|M|[E|[B[M|E BIM|E|[B[M|E|B|[M|E|[B[M  E|B|[M|E|B|[MI|E|B M\E\B\M\E\B\M\E\B\M\E\B\M\E\BET
1 1.0 Administrative and Legal Requirements of Plan 14 days Tue 3/5/13
Process
2 1.1 Conduct public hearing, including required 14 1 day Tue 2/19/13 @
day published notice
3 1.2 Adoption of resolution of intent to draft the 1 day Tue 3/12/13 @®
GWMP
4 1.3 CWC required, voluntary and suggested
components of GWMP
5 2.0 Groundwater Management Plan Development 286 days  Mon 4/1/13 v
Team
6 2.1 Establish GWMP Development Team 10 days Mon 4/1/13 Eq
7 2.2 Conduct initial meeting of GWMP 1day Mon 4/15/13
Development Team
8 ¥ 2.3 Conduct additional scheduled meetings of 241 days Mon 6/3/13 A A A A A A A A A A A A
GWMP Development Team
21 3.0 Outreach, Education, and Community 330days Mon4/1/13
Involvement
22 3.1 Organize City of Santa Barbara Basin Advisory 30 days Mon 4/1/13 —
Group
23 3.2 Conduct meetings of Advisory Group 270 days Sun6/2/13 v v v v v
29 (x 3.3 Conduct community outreach and education 270 days  Sun 6/2/13 * * *
on GWMP development (3 Workshops)
33 3.4 Provide information on community 0 days Wed 4/2/14 L4
involvement
35 4.0 Data Collection 66 days Wed 4/17/13
36 4.1 Conduct data collection from all available 66 days Wed 4/17/13
sources
37 5.0 Basin Analyses and Studies for Plan 219 days Wed 5/1/13 P SSSSSSSSSSSSSSSISIShOS—S—S—S—S—S—S———————
Development
38 5.1 Review all available data 154 days  Wed 5/1/13
39 5.2 Conduct analyses and studies to determine 176 days ~ Mon 7/1/13
optimum basins plan
40 6.0 Projects and Programs to Meet Goals and 201days Mon7/1/13
Objectives of the Plan
41 6.1 Review and consider all Basins analyses and 201 days Mon 7/1/13
studies
42 6.2 Identify and develop programs and projects 86 days Mon 12/9/13
for optimum basins plan
43 7.0 Draft Groundwater Management Plan 90 days Mon 2/3/14 O]
44 7.1 Prepare Draft GWMP 30 days Mon 2/3/14
45 7.2 Circulate Draft GWMP for review and 30 days Mon 3/17/14 E%L
comment
46 7.3 Receive and review comments on Draft 30 days Mon 4/28/14 esss———
GWMP
47 8.0 Quality Assurance/Quality Control 60 days Mon 3/17/14 e Y
48 8.1 QA/QC Analyses and Studies 5 days Mon 3/17/14 -
49 8.2 QA/QC BMOs, Recharge Map, Programs 5 days Mon 3/24/14 -
50 8.3 QA/QC GWMP 5 days Mon 3/31/14 -
51 9.0 Prepare Final Groundwater Management Plan 25 days Mon 6/9/14 U —4
52 9.1 Incorporate comments and changes into Final 15 days Mon 6/9/14 3
GWMP
53 9.2 Prepare Final GWMP for City Council 10 days Mon 6/30/14
Adoption
54 10.0 Public Hearing/Adoption of Groundwater 1 day Tue 7/15/14 v
Management Plan
55 10.1 Conduct a public hearing to receive 1day Tue 7/15/14 @®
comments on the Final GWMP
56 10.2 Adoption of the Final GWMP by the City 1day Tue 7/15/14 @®
Council
57 11.0 Final GWMP to DWR 1day Fri 7/18/14 v
58 11.1 Submit required copies of GWMP to DWR 1 day Fri7/18/14 L
59 11.2 Prepare and Submit a Final Project Report 1 day Fri7/18/14 L
60 12.0 Reporting 271days Tue 7/2/13
61 ¥ 12.1 Submit quarterly and annual Progress 262 days Tue7/2/13 @ @® @ @® @
Reports to DWR
Task G Summary === External Milestone L4 Inactive Summary U—— Manual Summary Rollup = Finish-only h|
E;iﬁc\t/\:/;t?}flij:;a Barbara AB 3 Split Goinnnonooono Project Summary P Inactive Task "] Manual Task B Manual Summary PE————====§ Deadline ¥
Milestone L 4 External Tasks Wl Inactive Milestone @ Duration-only Start-only C Progress ——
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